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Objection Letters 
  

Letter 
No. 

Objection 
codes 

Status Signatures Summary 

151 1, 2, 3, 4, 
5, 6, 7, 8, 
9, 10, 11, 
12 

MP 1 I understand that you are to review the decisions 
made by the LEA to reorganise Primary 
Education in Dudley. 
 
I did contribute to the initial 'consultation' in reply 
to the Dudley Borough Primary School 
Consultation Document. However, to date, I have 
received no adequate response to my questions 
and points, nor indeed have any of my 
constituents. The Education Department was 
totally overwhelmed by the response of local 
parents and residents and was not able to 
conduct anything like a consultation. Indeed if one 
reviews the Department's own figures one can 
see that almost three quarters of respondents 
rejected the Authority's plans. I do hope that you 
will be able to investigate the points in my 
contribution and hold the LEA to account for what 
I consider to be an ill conceived and badly 
managed situation. 
 
My concerns fall into eight main areas: 
1. I hope that you will investigate and censure the 
Director of Education and the Portfolio holder for 
failing to inform all four Borough MPs of their 
plans until after informing the local media. This I 
believe shows total disdain for the office of 
Member of Parliament and for the constituents we 
represent. Upon challenge on this point Mr 
Weston, Assistant Director admitted they hap 
'forgotten' to consult us as part of the initial group 
of consultees. (Contrary to Ministry Guidelines.) 

 
2. I am thankful that support is planned for 
different individuals and groups that may be 
affected by the changes to the primary schools in 
Dudley. However, change creates a delicate time 
in the lives of many people and it will be very 
difficult for students and their families, as well as 
the community as a whole, to adjust. Should 
these plans be accepted, students will be required 
to learn while adjusting to new environments and 
will face anxiety about change; the anxiety will 
create difficult amounts of stress that will affect 
learning.  
 
Moreover, many other people will be affected by 
the changes than just the primary school students 
and their families. Teachers, administrators, and 
support staff will all be affected with potential 
losses of careers or job relocation. Similarly, 
Dudley citizens will be affected by the change in 
traffic flow and business owners will be affected 
by the reduction in customers.  

 
I am curious to know if there is a guarantee that 
students will be able to attend the closest schools 
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to those that are being closed. It is very hard for 
students to transfer into different schools, and it 
will presumably be difficult for the students from 
the closing schools to transfer in. Having a 
guarantee will provide a smooth transition and the 
least drastic amounts of change and will cause 
the least disruption in the communities. 

 
On the same point, the authority does not address 
the changes to the students with special needs 
who attend the affected schools. Beauty Bank has 
a large percentage of students with special needs 
and they will especially feel the impact of all of the 
changes. 

 
3. While small schools are expensive to maintain, 
they provide alternatives to the large schools 
which the Borough seems intent to keep and 
expand. Keeping the small schools provides a 
choice, which provides the best option for all 
students. 
 
While I agree that critical factors in school 
performance are the quality of leadership, 
management, teaching, facilities, and sufficient 
budget, the Borough needs to realise that all of 
these factors are not independent. Teaching 
methods, and therefore the quality of teaching, 
can be very different when a teacher teaches a 
large class versus a small class. 
 
I am curious to know how each of these schools 
was chosen. Although I have read the relevant 
documents it is hard to understand the rationale 
of choice as not all of the schools are losing 
pupils at a fast rate in fact one can point to other 
schools in the Borough whose rolls are falling 
faster. 
 
It has been pointed out by my constituents at 
numerous meetings and is interesting to note 
also, that in each case of the five schools 
earmarked for closure, their political 
representation at council level is with an 
opposition party or in an area of high deprivation, 
minority ethnic concentration or on land which 
would release a high resale value. This is an 
unusual statistical anomaly which merits further 
investigation. 
 
4. It was very apparent from all of the parents and 
members of the community who desperately tried 
to save Beauty Bank Primary School that the 
school is an extremely loved and important part of 
the community. In addition, the school is more 
than just a primary school as it provides extended 
services for the family and the wider community 
and serves many adults, including adults who 
send their children to other primary schools. 
 
While Beauty Bank Primary School is an integral 
part of the Beauty Bank community, its role will be 
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inherently different if the building is no longer a 
school. Any converted buildings have different 
community roles. The needs of the community 
must be taken into account if the building is 
converted. However, I agree that if Beauty Bank 
Primary School must be converted that it remains 
as a community centre and is not used for any 
other purpose or bulldozed in order to have the 
land sold. I would also like to reiterate and receive 
assurance that all monies saved through 
combining the schools should be reinvested into 
education and should not be used in other 
pursuits. 
 
5. Ideally Beauty Bank Primary School should 
remain as a primary school in order to have it 
remain in its same and present community role. 
Has the Borough explored the option to use the 
available space in the schools for alternative 
purposes? If available space is used in more 
creative ways, education money can be saved 
and the changes in the community will be the 
least drastic. Many other authorities have faced 
falling rolls and employed creative ways of using 
premises such as children's centres, Sure Starts 
and so on. I would like the Authority to confirm 
and show evidence that they have investigated 
this and other options such as federation as 
suggested by local parents. I believe 
demonstration of such studies is a requirement of 
the Ministry's guidelines also. 
 
6. Furthermore, the Authority has not specified 
exactly where additional funding will come from in 
order to ‘merge' and build new schools. Nor does 
the Authority specify land available for new 
schools and in the particular case of 
Maidensbridge does not even specify a school 
with which to merge! Therefore, I ask the SOC to 
investigate where the funding will come from in 
order to merge and build the schools as well as to 
assist in the transition and identify land and 
timescales for the new schools. 
 
The Borough's track record is less than sparkling 
when considering that its plans to merge two 
Church of England schools in Halesowen, St John 
the Baptist and Hasbury have been rejected by 
the Education Minister twice already. Can the 
Authority guarantee this will not happen to their 
plans this time around? 
 
On the subject of merging or annexing schools. I 
have recently received many complaints from 
parents from Greenfield Primary School. These 
parents were only informed of the plans for their 
school on 16th December and given until 2nd 
January 06 to comment. This 'consultation' period 
has taken in the Christmas break and there has 
not been adequate time for parents to meet nor to 
consult with staff and Education Officers. Many of 
them have questions on class sizes and space for 
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pupils that will now go unanswered. Once again I 
believe the Department has treated my 
constituents with complete disdain and failed in 
their duty with respect to the staff, pupils and 
parents of this school. 
 
I am appalled that the Authority has also seen fit 
to cut the admission numbers for Mount Pleasant 
School. This will mean that the school will receive 
less money and eventually may have to lose staff. 
This effectively means death by a thousand cuts 
for this wonderful little school. The school has 
been praised by OFSTED for its methods and 
standards and is world renowned for its methods 
of team teaching and ethos. Cutting admissions 
for this school effectively shuts it down year by 
year. Once again sacrificing standards for the 
balance sheet. 
 
8. While the annual birth rate in, Dudley has 
gradually fallen from a peak of 4,116 in 1990, this 
falls in line with the cyclical nature of birth rates. 
The Authority did not specifically answer my point 
about the different generations and the cyclical 
increases and decreases in population that 
corresponds with the different generations. 
 

ONS projected population numbers for Dudley 
between the present and 2028 suggest that the 
population decline reaches a low point and then 
rebounds afterwards; supporting that the rise and 
decline of birth rates are cyclical. Similarly, the 
numbers provided do not take into account a 
change in population based on people staying in 
Dudley longer and an increase in immigration 
which will add to the population should the 
objectives of the Black Country Study be 
achieved. 

 
I feel that it is very unfortunate that the Authority 
has taken the option of closing schools and not 
really addressed any of the concerns or 
suggestions posed by my constituents. I believe 
that the schools are closing without just cause 
and that they are an irreplaceable treasure to the 
entire community. I do not believe that the 
Authority has actually taken on board their 
responsibilities to the community and that the 
consultation was merely a paper exercise. 
 
I am asking the SOC to reject these plans and 
hope that you will see them for what they are, an 
ill conceived plan simply to close schools without 
looking seriously at alternatives that could benefit 
pupils, staff and community alike. An attempt 
simply to cut costs demonstrating that the 
planners understand the costs but not the value of 
the service that these schools provide. If you 
reject these plans they will have to be 
investigated by an independent adjudicator. I am 
sure that at this point these plans and this so 
called 'consultation' will not stand up to scrutiny. 
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194 1, 11, 13, 
14, 15, 16, 
17, 18, 19, 
20 

MP 1 I am writing to set out my objection to the 
statutory notice issued by the local authority 
proposing the closures of two schools in my 
constituency, Highfields and Sycamore Green. 
 
I wrote to the Council in October objecting to the 
proposed closures of these two schools and 
enclosed letters and petitions sent to me by 
parents and children which demonstrated the 
strength of feeling against them. I would like to 
ask that those letters and petitions are considered 
by the School Organisation Committee. 
 
I have not received any response to those letters 
or the proposals and suggestions they made, nor 
have I received any answers to the questions I 
raised. More importantly, parents tell me they 
have received no response to their letters, 
questions and petitions either. The local authority 
has also failed to ensure people have been 
properly notified of the statutory notices and told 
how they can respond. 
 
The number of letters and petitions these 
proposals generated shows how deeply parents 
care about these issues and the council's failure 
to show that it has considered the points they 
have raised has undermined the trust people 
have in the process. 
 
Surely parents should have been written to and 
told how they could respond to the notices. At the 
very least the council should have written to all of 
those who wrote to the initial consultation period, 
setting out the details of the statutory notices and 
inviting them to respond. 
 
I am sorry to say that I and many parents believe 
the consultation process has been unsatisfactory, 
and it is because I believe that the other 
proposals that have been suggested by the 
schools, governors and parents should have been 
properly considered, that I am calling on the 
council to halt this process, think again, look 
carefully at the alternative suggestions, respond 
to them properly and produce alternatives that do 
not involve the closure of either school. 
 
Driving forward with the original plans to close 
these two schools without having responded 
properly to the case put forward by parents, 
governors and the public will increase resentment 
at these decisions. 
 
Surely if the council believes it has arrived at the 
right decisions, it can answer in detail the 
questions raised and suggestions made and 
explain why its proposals would better serve the 
education of local children than the alternatives 
put forward. 
 
1. Birth-rates 
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My objections are based on the fact that I do not 
agree with the premise the council has put 
forward for changing the current pattern of 
primary schools. 
 
The council has failed to answer the entirely 
legitimate criticism and questioning of the 
projections it has put forward for birth rates. I 
have examined the ONS figures on birth rates 
and I believe ONS data actually suggests birth 
rates could be increasing, not falling. 
 
For example, the total fertility rate in the UK was 
1.77 children per woman in 2004, 1.71 in 2003 
and has increased from 1.63 in 2001. 
 
Second, I commissioned independent expert 
research from the House of Commons Library 
which shows that the underlying assumptions do 
not take into account the fact birth rate trends 
might rise in the future. They do not consider the 
impact that policies such as the child tax credit, 
increased support for childcare, better maternity 
and paternity pay and leave and the Child Trust 
Fund. 
 
Third, the proposals also do not take into account 
other issues that could result in increased 
population in Dudley. For example, the council is 
supporting the Black Country Study. One of its 
objectives is increasing the area's population by 
100,000. Has the impact that this and other 
external factors such as immigration could have 
on school numbers been taken into account? 
 
Fourth, can the council show it has taken into 
account the impact-increased housing 
development in Dudley North will have on pupil 
numbers? For example, outline planning 
permission is being sought to develop 250 homes 
on land next to Highfields and there are plans to 
develop 700 homes in an urban village nearby. 
Both of these developments would clearly 
increase the need for school places. There is also 
a proposal to develop some 200 homes at the old 
Shaw’s Factory site near Sycamore Green. 
 
If birth rates are increasing, and these other 
factors result in a population increase, closing 
schools could well result in too few places to meet 
future needs. 
 
2. Pupil numbers 
I do not accept that rolls are falling so dramatically 
at these two schools that closure is the only 
option. 
 
As I understand it the council's policy is to have 
no school with more than 15% surplus places. 
The number of pupils at Highfields is not very far 
below this figure at the moment and meeting this 
requirement could easily be done by some of the 
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measures set out later. 
 
Under the Council's proposals, it is not at all clear 
where the 7.5% extra capacity the council wishes 
to provide would be in Coseley. The extra spaces 
proposed in the area would be needed for the 
children from Highfields. The council proposes to 
make available spare capacity at Hurst Hill, but 
that involves crossing the busiest road in the 
borough which is counter to both the council's and 
what I understand are the government's 
guidelines. 
 
Similarly, reducing admissions at Sycamore 
Green to one class entry would reduce capacity to 
210 which again could easily be achieved by 
developing a nursery or by some of the other 
proposals set out later. 
 
3. Alternatives 
Even if the council's case that surplus places 
have arisen and birth rates are falling is correct, I 
do not accept that closing schools is the only way 
of addressing them. 
 
I do not necessarily accept the council's assertion 
that smaller schools with fewer pupils would find it 
difficult to sustain high quality education and staff 
structures can be altered to reflect pupil numbers.
 
Better still, schools can look to provide extra 
facilities. For example, both Highfields and 
Sycamore Green would be ideally suited to the 
development of Sure Start Children's Centres, for 
example. Both schools are in deprived areas that 
could qualify for such provision, both have the 
space needed and such provision would generate 
increased revenue to help meet the cost of 
running the buildings. 
 
Governors at both schools have also drawn up 
proposals for extended schools provision which 
will increase both numbers of children and the 
use of the buildings. 
 
Both schools have plans to provide new nurseries 
which would increase the numbers of children 
going into the schools and address the decline in 
numbers at both schools. 
 
Highfields, for example, has already applied to 
Ofsted to register for pre-school provision. Their 
target date is this January. Governors at 
Sycamore Green are in discussion with the local 
authority about early years provision as well. 
 
What thought has been given to using part of the 
buildings to expand other community provision? 
Both schools are used by various community 
groups and have plans to expand such provision. 
Such facilities could be provided at both schools 
without requiring new buildings.  
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There are many other ways in which local 
authorities have reduced surplus places  that 
have not involved the closure of schools by, for 
example, combining the school  with other 
community facilities, providing "wrap-around" 
childcare or moving in educational support 
facilities, libraries, extended schools and so on. 
 
Can I reiterate my request that these proposals 
and others I know have been made I by parents, 
teachers and governors at the schools be 
considered properly before any final decisions are 
taken? 
 
4. Conclusion 
Both schools and Sycamore Green in particular, 
serve areas of high deprivation where children 
need more support and stability, not less. 
 
Results at both schools are going up. Sycamore 
Green is achieving 82% in literacy, 63% in maths 
and 82% in science. 
 
Standards are increasing rapidly at Highfields as 
well, which has just achieved record SATS 
results. 54 of Highfields' children have special 
needs and the school has been complimented by 
the local authority on the provision it makes for 
them. 
 
Facilities at both schools are of a high quality and 
have been improved with extra investment 
recently. These facilities, combined with the ethos 
at the schools and the support they receive from 
parents and the wider community are serving the 
children well and I am very worried that their 
education will be destabilised by these changes. 
 
The council should answer properly the 
questions, criticisms and questions put forward. It 
should think again and bring forward proposals 
that prevent the closure of these two schools. 
 
I ask that the School Organisation Committee 
take these points and the other objections into 
account, ask the council to produce alternatives 
that do not involve the closure of these schools 
and refer the proposals to the Independent 
schools adjudicator. 
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Itemised Points of Objection. 
 

Obj Code Objection point 
1 Adequate responses to questions, suggestions and concerns have not been provided 

by DMBC.  
2 Almost three quarters of respondents to consultation rejected the Authority’s plans. 
3 The Authority failed to inform Borough MPs of their plans until after informing the 

local media. 
4 Students, families and communities as a whole will find it very difficult to adjust to any 

changes. 
5 Students will need to adjust to new environments and will face anxiety and stress 

which will affect learning. 
6 Teachers, administrators and support staff will all be affected with potential losses of 

careers or job relocation. 
7 Dudley citizens will be affected by traffic flow and business owners will be affected by 

reduction in customers. 
8 Closure of small schools removes parental choice. 
9 Teaching methods and quality of teaching are affected when teaching larger classes. 
10 The Authority has not specified exactly where funding will come from to ‘merge’ and 

build new schools, nor land available for new schools. 
11 Any rise and decline in birth rates are of a cyclical nature and will increase again. 
12 This is merely a paper exercise to cut costs and has not taken into account the value 

of service provided by the school. 
13 The impact of policies such as child tax credit, increased support for childcare, better 

maternity and paternity pay and leave and the Child Trust fund on birth rates has not 
been taken into account. 

14 The impact of increased housing development in the area has not been taken into 
account. 

15 Reducing admissions at Sycamore Green to one class entry would reduce capacity 
to 210, which could easily be achieved by other methods. 

16 Proposals for extended schools provision, nurseries and other facilities have been 
drawn up for the school to help with falling admission numbers, but this fact has been 
ignored by the local authority. 

17 Sycamore Green serves areas of high deprivation where children need more support 
and stability, not less. 

18 School academic results are increasing. 
19 Facilities are of a high quality and have recently been improved with extra 

investment. 
20 The local authority has failed to ensure people have been properly notified of the 

statutory notices and told how they can respond.  
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